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On October 1, The Nobel Prize in Physiology or Medicine 2018 was awarded jointly to Dr. James P. Allison and Dr.
Tasuku Honjo "for their discovery of cancer therapy by inhibition of negative immune regulation.

The Nobel Assembly at Karolinska Institute released the comments that Dr. Allison and Dr. Honjo showed how
different strategies for inhibiting the brakes on the immune system could be used in the treatment of cancer[1-5]. The
seminal discoveries by the two laureates constitute a landmark in our fight against cancer.
https://www.nobelprize.org/prizes/medicine/2018/prize-announcement/

I sincerely wish to congratulate two recipients, co-workers and many patients cooperated in clinical trials. In this
journal, we have published several reviews and papers on immunity checkpoints so far. The reason is that the mission of
this journal is in scientific awareness and dissemination of new immunotherapy.

I herein introduce briefly my previous report with some modification[6]. Immune checkpoints inhibitors (ICIs) have
opened promising avenues in the treatment of cancer. Various blocking antibodies targeting programmed cell death -1
(PD-1) and cytotoxic T-lymphocyte-associated protein 4 (CTLA-4) are approved for human use. They significantly
improved disease outcome in a number of cancer patients by boosting anti-tumor immune responses. As Seidel, Otsuka
and Kabashima described in their review article[7], mortality among advanced stage patients and the frequency of
treatment-related adverse events remain high with current treatment. And, it is also noteworthy that unexpected immune
related adverse effects (irAEs) appear, even when it becomes better to be administered to many cancer patients[8].
Unfortunately, the mechanisms of endocrine irAEs by ICIs, remain unclear, and optimal prevention, prediction, and
treatment of the irAEs are still uncertain. However, appropriate uses and index setting related to prognosis are being
studied in many fields such as dermatology[9] and other organs[6,7].

While solving such problems, we have to understand that the mechanisms of immunogenic cell death are now
moving from concepts to the clinic. We will explain the mechanism behind ICD and how it will perhaps breathe a new
life into chemotherapy use in cancer, not front and center but as a helpful hand to immunotherapy[10].

For a long time many scientists or doctors attempted to engage the immune system in the fight against cancer.
Many clinicians stared at cancer patients who were to be dying by their side, mourning their inability. However, cancer
therapy by inhibition of negative immune regulation checkpoint therapy has fundamentally changed the way we view
how cancer can be managed and many patients will receive much better care and cure.
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